

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF WISCONSIN

In re:

Archdiocese of Milwaukee

Case No. 11-20059-SVK
Chapter 11

Debtor in Possession

QUARTERLY APPLICATION OF HOWARD SOLOCHEK & WEBER, S.C., LOCAL COUNSEL
FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS, FOR INTERIM
COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES (QUARTERLY FROM JANUARY
1, 2011 TO MARCH 31, 2011)

The quarterly application (the "Application") of Howard, Solochek & Weber, S.C., local counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the "Committee"), for an order pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §330, F.R.B.P. 2016 and Rule 2016 of the Local Rules of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Eastern District of Wisconsin, respectfully requests as follows:

1. On January 4, 2011 (the "Filing Date"), Archdiocese of Milwaukee (the "Debtor") commenced these proceedings by filing a voluntary petition for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code (the "Code").
2. On or about January 24, 2011, (Docket No. 86), the United States Trustee appointed the Committee to represent the unsecured creditors of the Debtor pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §1102(a)(1).
3. On February 5, 2011, (Docket No. 109), the Committee filed an application with this Court for authorization to employ Applicant pursuant to 11 U.S.C. 1103.
4. On February 24, 2011, (Docket No. 154), this Court entered an order authorizing the Committee to employ the Applicant as local counsel for the Committee.
5. Applicant has rendered services from January 1, 2011 through March 31, 2011 totaling 127.80 hours.
6. Applicant maintains contemporaneous records of the time expended for the professional services and expenses performed in connection with this Chapter 11 case and

such records are maintained in the ordinary course of its business. These records provide a detailed description of the services rendered and expenses incurred during the period for which this Application is being made. A summary of the Applicant's time records is attached. This summary is broken down according to subject matter categories relating specifically to this Chapter 11 case. If the Court requires any further descriptions on these time entries, Applicant will provide additional information.

7. Applicant believes that the post-petition services for the period January 1, 2011 through March 31, 2011 ("Compensation Period") are reasonably worth the sum of \$27,925.00 as set forth in the summary attached. Applicant notes that these fees are customary charges made to other firm clients in the ordinary course of its billing practice. To assist the Court in its review of the fees sought by Applicant, Applicant has separated its time entries into the following categories:

a. Case Administration: (Total hours: 88:00, total fees \$19,295.00) This category includes time spent by Applicant attending to coordination and compliance activities in connection with the performance of its duties as local counsel for the Committee, including: review of Debtor's Schedules and SOFAS; compliance with Local Rules, and compliance with Judge's Court rules.

b. Application: (Total hours: 11:10, total fees \$2,402.50). This category is related to fee applications of Applicant and other interested parties.

c. Claims of Creditors: (Total hours: 3:40, total fees \$765.00). This category is related to matters regarding proofs of claim, claims filed and hearing on claims.

d. Creditor's Committee: (Total hours: 15:10, total fees \$3,310.00) This category includes time spent preparing for and attending Committee meetings and miscellaneous Committee-related tasks.

e. Court Hearings: (Total hours: _____, total fees \$_____). This category includes time spent preparing for and attending hearings and communications regarding the same.

f. Contested Matters/Motions: (Total hours: ____, total fees \$_____). This category includes time spent reviewing miscellaneous motions and communications regarding the same.

g. Disclosure Statement and Plan: (Total hours: ____, total fees \$_____). This category relates to the review of the Debtor's Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization.

h. Compromises: (Total hours: ____, total fees \$_____). This category relates to matters regarding review of transfers and conveyances of the Debtor, including adversary proceedings.

i. Discovery: (Total hours: 10:20, total fees \$2,152.50). This category relates to matters regarding discovery, local rule compliance and attendance at discovery hearings and depositions.

8. Applicant further requests reimbursement of costs expended from January 1, 2011 through March 31, 2011 in the sum of \$1,452.90 as set forth in the summary attached. Applicant notes that these costs are customary charges made to other firm clients in the ordinary course of its billing practice.

9. Applicant avers that it has not received any compensation for services rendered and expenses incurred for the time period for which this application is made.

WHEREFORE, Applicant prays this Court to enter an Order granting Applicant compensation from January 1, 2011 through March 31, 2011 in the amount of \$27,925.00 and reimbursement of expenses expended from January 1, 2011 through March 31, 2011 in the sum of \$1452.90.

Dated this 4th day of April, 2011.

HOWARD SOLOCHEK & WEBER, S.C.

/s/

Albert Solochek

Jason R. Pilmaier

324 E. Wisconsin Ave., Suite 1100

Milwaukee, WI 53202

Local Counsel for the Official Committee of
Unsecured Creditors

4/4/2011
4:16 PM

Howard, Solochek & Weber, S.C.
Billing Worksheet Summary

Page 1

Client	Billable: Fees	Unbillable: Fees	Interest Fin charge	Payments Credits	Prior bal
Last bill	Costs	Costs	Tax fees	Wrt offs	New charges
Last charge	Hours	Hours	Tax costs	Refunds	New A/R
					New bal
Arch-Admin	19295.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
3/31/2011	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	19295.00
	88.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	19295.00
Arch-Applicatio	2402.50	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
3/30/2011	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	2402.50
	11.10	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	2402.50
Arch-Claims	765.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
2/25/2011	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	765.00
	3.40	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	765.00
Arch-Costs	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
3/1/2011	1452.90	0.00	0.00	0.00	1452.90
	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	1452.90
Arch-CredCom	3310.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
2/28/2011	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	3310.00
	15.10	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	3310.00
Arch-Discovery	2152.50	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
3/31/2011	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	2152.50
	10.20	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	2152.50
Archdiocese	27925.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
3/31/2011	1452.90	0.00	0.00	0.00	29377.90
	127.80	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
			0.00	0.00	29377.90

April 04, 2011

Invoice # 32304

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/26/2011	AS	Preparation and draft of Application regarding Retention (.8); Research regarding the same (.3); Correspondence and follow up regarding Application and conference (.2); Conference with Daryl Diesing on §341, Schedules, Notice etc (1.0); Follow up on Application (.3)	2.60 225.00/hr 585.00
	JRP	Phone call with Attorney Stang regarding Applications to Employ, .3; Conference with Attorney Solochek regarding Applications to Employ and case status, .3; Preparation on Applications to Employ, Affidavit and Proposed Order, .7.	1.30 200.00/hr 260.00
1/27/2011	JRP	Preparation on Applications to Employ and Affidavit, .4; review with Attorney Solochek, .2.	0.60 200.00/hr 120.00
	AS	Several correspondences from and to Jim Stang regarding Applications, Debtor Application, §341, Committee meeting et al (.4); Conference with Jim Stang regarding Applications and Document's Applications (.4); Additional correspondence regarding the same (.3); Draft of language for Attorney Solochek Affidavit and Application and correspondence regarding the same (.4); Preparation regarding the same (.3); Notes and correspondence on Committee By Laws (.3); Conference with Clerk Lawa on Document's Application (.2); Conference with Dave Asbach regarding §341 (.3); Additional preparation on Applications (.3)	2.60 225.00/hr 585.00
1/28/2011	AS	Follow up regarding Committee Applications (.4); Review of correspondence regarding the same (.3); Conference with Daryl Diesing on parishes issue, other items, §341, current issues and insurance (.6); Notes regarding the same (.2); Conference with Jim Stang regarding Daryl Diesing's points and issues and	3.20 225.00/hr 720.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	status and strategy regarding 4-5 items from Daryl Diesing (.6); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing regarding parishes, financials and 5 issues regarding Notice, et al (.8); Correspondence to Charles Linneman, Jeff Anderson and Mike Finnegan regarding Applications (.3)		
1/30/2011 AS	Review of Jim Stang correspondence regarding Committee et al (.3); Correspondence from Jeff Anderson and parties regarding the same and Attorney Solochek's responses regarding the same and §341 (.4); Review of additional list of items (.3); Notes for the §341 (.3)	1.30 225.00/hr	292.50
1/31/2011 AS	Correspondence from and to Daryl Diesing (.3); Note on Committee Rules (.2); Follow up correspondence and Applications (.2); Review of items requested (.2); Notes on financials (.2); Additional information and correspondence on contact information (.2); Additional correspondence (.1); Conference with Diane Himojosa (.2); Correspondence to parties on Application and §341 (.3)	1.90 225.00/hr	427.50
2/1/2011 AS	Follow up on Documents and notes for §341	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
2/2/2011 AS	Follow up on Applications (.2); Review of materials (.2); Several correspondences from and to Therese & Jeff Anderson offices (.4); Phone calls with Gillian Brown (.1); Phone call and correspondence with Daryl Diesing and notes regarding the same (.4); Correspondence with Gillian Brown (.1); Phone call and correspondence from and to Daryl Diesing (.2); Phone call and correspondence with Gillian Brown (.2)	1.80 225.00/hr	405.00
2/3/2011 AS	Review of checklist (.3); Receipt of Applications and follow up for filing (.3); Conference with Gillian Brown regarding status, Affidavit and §341 hearing (.4); Phone call and follow up with Pam Bartoli (.3); Conference with Jeff Anderson (.8); Review of correspondence (.4); Checklist (.1)	2.60 225.00/hr	585.00
2/4/2011 AS	Receipt and initial review of materials from Patrick Wall (.8); Correspondence to and from Charles Linneman regarding Application regarding Retention (.3); Correspondence from Pamela Bartoli and correspondence to Group regarding schedules (.3); Notes regarding schedules (.3); Initial review of information from Pamela Bartoli (.3)	2.00 225.00/hr	450.00
2/5/2011 JRP	Assemble and electronically file applications to employ counsel and local counsel for Creditor's Committee, .4; conference with Attorney Solochek regarding applications, .2	0.60 200.00/hr	120.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/7/2011	AS Follow up on Documents (.3); Notes regarding Schedules (.2); Follow up on correspondence with Therese Gallagher (.2); Correspondence from Pamela Bartoli on Documents et al (.2); Correspondence to Pamela Bartoli on remaining Documents (.2); Additional correspondence from Pamela Bartoli (.3); Correspondence with Jim Stang (.1)	1.50 225.00/hr	337.50
2/8/2011	JRP Correspondence with Gillian Brown, .2; conference with Attorney Solocheck, .2; review of Debtor's schedules, .7.	1.10 200.00/hr	220.00
	AS Review and analysis of Schedules (1.3); Correspondence memo to Anderson Group regarding the Schedules et al (.6); Meeting with Peter Ilsley on facts regarding Milwaukee Archdiocese et al (1.3)	3.20 225.00/hr	720.00
2/9/2011	JRP Review debtor's schedules, .3; conference with attorney Solocheck regarding §341 and strategy, .4; phone conference with counsel for committee, 1.0.	1.70 200.00/hr	340.00
	AS Review of additional Schedules (.3); Review of Article (.3); Additional notes regarding §341 inquiries (.3); Follow up for Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence to Committee and Anderson Group (.2); Phone call and correspondence to Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence to Jim Stang on Motions (.2); Review and memo regarding Schedules--assets and questions for Conference (.6); Conference with Gillian Brown regarding Schedules and §341 hearing and questions and notes (1.3); Correspondence regarding conference call (.2); Review of correspondence from Gillian Brown (.3); Review of documents and correspondence to Group regarding the same (.4); Notes regarding the same (.1)	4.60 225.00/hr	1,035.00
	AS Conference call with Jeff Anderson, Mike Finnigan, Gillian Brown, Ken Brown and Pat Wall regarding how to address and approach the §341 hearing and points related thereto--follow up and notes regarding the same (1.2); Correspondence to parties regarding §341 hearing (.8)	2.00 225.00/hr	450.00
2/10/2011	AS Review of Questions and Faith in the Future et al--questions and memo regarding the same et al (1.3); Phone calls with Daryl Diesing (.2); Review of Gillian Brown's outline and revisions (.3); Conference with Dave Asbach and correspondence regarding §341 hearing and notes (.3); Correspondence regarding the same (.1); Conference with and meeting with Dave Asbach regarding §341 hearing and other matters in the case and notes regarding the same (1.2); Correspondence memo to PSZJ and Anderson Group on	4.60 225.00/hr	1,035.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	Asbach meeting (.8); Correspondence from Jim Stang and to Dave Asbach (.4)		
2/11/2011 AS	Review of Schedules, Notes and materials for §341 hearing (.6); Meeting with Gillian Brown regarding §341 and case points (.9); Conference with Daryl Diesing (.3); Meeting with Jeff Anderson, Gillian Brown et al regarding §341 (1.3); Attendance and participation in §341 hearing (2.4); Conference with Daryl Diesing regarding the same (.6); Conference with Gillian Brown regarding follow up regarding §341 hearing and items for the case (1.0); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing regarding financials (.3); Review of Faith in the Future et al (.4)	7.80 225.00/hr	1,755.00
JRP	Meeting with Attorney Solochek, Attorney Brown, Attorney Anderson regarding 341 meeting and case status, 1.0; Attend 341 meeting of creditors, 2.2; Conference with Attorney Solochek and Attorney Brown regarding case status, 1.0	4.20 200.00/hr	840.00
2/14/2011 AS	Phone call and correspondence to Jim Stang--update regarding §341 and Motion and Notice (.3); Correspondence to Committee and Anderson Group on Article (.3); Correspondence with Committee (.2); Research and analysis on WS 242 on intent and discovery and WS 893 (.9); Review of Dolan articles (.4); Review on several correspondences from Jeff Anderson (.4); Several correspondences from and to Paul Scopture (.4); Correspondence to Group regarding WS 242 and notes regarding the same (.6); Checklist regarding the same (.3); Additional correspondence with Jim Stang (.3)	4.10 225.00/hr	922.50
2/15/2011 AS	Notes for Motion and Order per Jim Stang (.3); Notes on WS 242 (.3); Notes on Committee Meeting (.2); Notes on status of report from Daryl Diesing (.3); Review on Documents (.3); Review of Jeff Anderson correspondence and follow up for New York Times (.2); Phone call with Daryl Diesing (.1); Review of motion and correspondence from Jim Stang and response regarding the same (.4); Conference with Paul Vitello from New York Times (.4); Notes and phone call with Daryl Diesing (.1)	2.60 225.00/hr	585.00
JRP	Research various legal issues, .4; conference with Attorney Solochek regarding case status, committee meeting, and follow up from 341 meeting, .8.	1.20 200.00/hr	240.00
2/16/2011 JRP	Review correspondence from Attorney James Stang and Gillian Brown, .3; Review notes to Creditors Committee, .2.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
AS	Review of several correspondences and memos on Debtor's Motions, Notice et al (.4); Correspondence to Jim Stang and Group on US Trustee points regarding pre-petition settlements	2.60 225.00/hr	585.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	(.3); Correspondence to Jim Stang and Group on Notice and US Trustee and notes regarding the same (.4); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing regarding Financial Statements (.2); Correspondence regarding Committee and status points (.2); Notes and phone call and correspondence with Daryl Diesing (.1); Conference with Jim Stang on Mediation Notices et al (.6); Conference with Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence with Daryl Diesing (.2)		
2/17/2011	JRP Preparation and attendance at meeting of creditor's committee.	1.50 200.00/hr	300.00
	AS Follow up on 3 Motions (.2); Notes regarding Daryl Diesing and Dave Asbach (.2); Notes regarding Committee meeting (.2); Notes on WS 242 & 893 (.3); Phone call and correspondence regarding conference--Jim Stang & Daryl Diesing (.2); Review on WS 893 (.3); Conference with Dave Asbach and Jim Stang regarding Motions, Notices, et al (.6); Conference with Jim Stang regarding the same (.3); Conference with Daryl Diesing and Jim Stang on 3 Motions, documents, Supreme Court et al (.8); Conference call with Creditor Committee regarding status, issues et al (1.8)	4.90 225.00/hr	1,102.50
2/18/2011	JRP Review correspondence from Gillian Brown regarding employment of professionals, .2; follow up on transcript of 341 meeting, .3.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
	AS Notes and follow up from conference call with Creditor Committee (.4); Conference with Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence to Jim Stang and follow up regarding Daryl Diesing (.2); Receipt and process of §341 Audio (.3); Initial review of orders (.3)	1.40 225.00/hr	315.00
2/21/2011	AS Review of correspondence from Jim Stang and Jeff Anderson regarding 2 Motions--correspondence to and from Jim Stang regarding the same (.4); Follow up on correspondence regarding Mediation program and comments (.3); Correspondence regarding Orders (.2); Notes on 2004s (.2); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing on Order (.3); Correspondence with Gillian Brown (.1); Correspondence with Daryl Diesing (.2); Review of 2004 Template and comments regarding the same (.8)	2.50 225.00/hr	562.50
2/22/2011	AS Correspondence from Gillian Brown and response regarding Milwaukee Supporting Fund (.3); Review of article and correspondence to Committee et al (.2); Review of electronic filings regarding Certificate and correspondence with Dave Asbach regarding the same (.4); Correspondence to Jim Stang	2.20 225.00/hr	495.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	et al on Certificate by US Trustee (.3); Several correspondences from Mike Finnegan on 5 different funds and initial review regarding the same (.3); Notes on pending Motions (.3); Conference with Clerk and modification of order and correspondence to Jim Stang and Gillian Brown (.4)		
2/23/2011	JRP Review docket entries; prepare and file affidavits of no objection and proposed orders to employment applications.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
	AS Follow up on Retention Order and correspondence regarding the same (.4); Notes on Insurance (.3); Review of Agenda and correspondence regarding the same (.4)	1.10 225.00/hr	247.50
2/24/2011	JRP Review multiple correspondence from Attorney Jim Stang, .5, Attend Creditors committee meeting, 1.3	1.80 200.00/hr	360.00
	AS Review of Agenda--insurance--state of order et al (.8); Notes on 242 item(.2); Review of Proof of Claim and confirmation orders (.3); Correspondence from and to and from Jim Stang regarding entities (.2); Notes regarding the same (.1); Conference call with Creditor Committee and memo regarding the same (1.3)	2.90 225.00/hr	652.50
2/25/2011	AS Review of recession issue and analysis and review and analysis regarding fraudulent inducement (.8); Correspondence and memo to Jim Stang regarding the same (.6); Correspondence from and to Jim Stang regarding the same (.6); Conference with Jim Stang on Fraudulent inducement, Notice, Claims, special hearing et al (.8); Memo regarding the same (.2); Correspondence from Dave Asbach and comments regarding the same (.4)	3.40 225.00/hr	765.00
2/28/2011	ANH Prepared draft quantity application form	0.90 225.00/hr	202.50
	AS Review of Jeff Anderson correspondence, checklist and Dolan articles	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/1/2011	AS Review of correspondence and electronic filings with Court and notes regarding the same (.4); Review of Dolan correspondence (.2)	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/2/2011	JRP Review CM/ECF filings, .3; various correspondences to Gillian Brown and attorneys for the committee, .4.	0.70 200.00/hr	140.00
3/3/2011	ANH Review of 2004 (local rules compliance) (.9); Review of agenda and proposed bar date issues (.4); Participation in conference call with Creditor Committee (1.0)	2.30 225.00/hr	517.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/4/2011	JRP	0.80 200.00/hr	160.00
	AS	1.20 225.00/hr	270.00
3/7/2011	JRP	1.20 200.00/hr	240.00
	AS	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/8/2011	AS	0.80 225.00/hr	180.00
3/9/2011	JRP	0.70 200.00/hr	140.00
	AS	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
3/10/2011	JRP	1.80 200.00/hr	360.00
	AS	1.20 225.00/hr	270.00
3/14/2011	AS	1.60 225.00/hr	360.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/14/2011	JRP Review docket and electronic filings, .5; phone conference with Attorney Solochek regarding case status and newly filed motions, .3; phone call to Gillian Brown, .2.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
3/15/2011	AS Review of correspondence and notes regarding Response to Motion (.3); Review of correspondence and 2004 Discovery and correspondence with Gillian Brown and Daryl Diesing (.6); Correspondence regarding the same and memo regarding the Discovery (.3)	1.20 225.00/hr	270.00
3/16/2011	JRP Review correspondence from Jim Stang regarding various motions, .2; review correspondence from Daryl Diesing regarding motions and conference, .2; review 2004 documents, .3; phone call to Attorney Gillian Brown regarding motion and objection dates, .2; conference with attorney Solochek regarding status, .2.	1.10 200.00/hr	220.00
3/17/2011	AS Review of correspondence--meeting and bylaws (.4); Review of Dean Westwalk correspondence et al (.3); Correspondence to Jim Stang et al regarding the same (.4)	1.10 225.00/hr	247.50
	JRP Review agenda and preparation for creditor's committee meeting, .3; attend creditor's committee meeting and notes regarding the same, 1.1.	1.40 200.00/hr	280.00
3/18/2011	AS Follow up and review strategy (.4)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
3/21/2011	AS Review of correspondence and electronic filings	0.80 225.00/hr	180.00
3/22/2011	AS Review of correspondence on hearing (.4); Follow up on response (.3); Review of Jeff Anderson notes (.3)	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
3/23/2011	AS Follow up on Motion and Requests	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/24/2011	JRP Correspondence with Ken Brown and Gillian Brown regarding pending motions and hearing, .2; phone conference regarding pending motions and issues related to upcoming conference with Debtor, .3, attend creditor's committee meeting and preparation for the same, 1.2.	1.70 200.00/hr	340.00
	AS Review of correspondence regarding hearing (.4); Review of correspondence and Motions and response and 4/5 date (.6); Correspondence with Ken Brown and Gillian Brown (.4); Follow up regarding hearing before Judge Kelly (.4); Notes (.2); Review	2.30 225.00/hr	517.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	of Agenda (.3)		
3/25/2011	JRP Review correspondence from Gillian Brown and Ken Brown regarding pending motions and 2004 requests, .3; phone conference with Attorney Jeff Anderson and Mike Finnigan regarding upcoming hearing and pending meeting, .3; phone conference with Daryl Diesing, and committee counsel regarding motions and 2004 request issues, 1.0.	1.60 200.00/hr	320.00
	AS Follow up on discovery - 4/5 date et al	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/28/2011	AS Notes on Motion status et al	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
	JRP Correspondence with Daryl Diesing and Michael Gosman regarding Motion and hearing on Motions, .3; correspondence with Gillian Brown and Ken Brown regarding motions and 2004 status, .3; review correspondence regarding employment of professional, .2; phone conference with Gillian Brown and Frank Lococo regarding 2004 documents and system for document delivery and review, .5.	1.30 200.00/hr	260.00
3/29/2011	AS Follow up on Motion regarding 4/5 (.4); correspondence with Daryl Diesing regarding hearings (.4); notes with Jeff Anderson (.3)	1.10 225.00/hr	247.50
	JRP Review status with Jeff Anderson and Mike Finnigan, .3; conference with Daryl Diesing and the court clerk regarding hearing on pending motions, .3; correspondence with Gillian Brown and Ken Brown regarding hearing, .2.	0.80 200.00/hr	160.00
3/30/2011	AS Follow up on correspondence - filings - with Ken Brown	0.80 225.00/hr	180.00
	JRP Review professional application and supporting documents, .3; review and preparation on Objections to various motions filed by the Debtor and correspondence regarding the same, .4; correspondence with Gillian Brown regarding April 5 hearing and Debtor's motions, .2.	0.90 200.00/hr	180.00
3/31/2011	AS Review of correspondence, memos, etc regarding 2004 motion and filing regarding the same (.8); Numerous correspondences with Gillian and Ken Brown and Jim Stang on Debtors motion and 4/5 hearing (1.0); Review of Objection for 4/5 hearing and preparation regarding the same (.9); Review of electronic filing and correspondence to all (.6)	3.30 225.00/hr	742.50

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/31/2011 JRP Preparation on Notice of Motions and Certificate of service regarding 2004 motion, .4; multiple correspondence regarding preparation, review, and filing of the 2004 motion, .3; phone conference with Attorney Ken Brown, .2; preparation for creditor's committee meeting and attendance at creditor's committee meeting, 1.3.	2.20 200.00/hr	440.00
For professional services rendered	<u>127.80</u>	<u>\$27,925.00</u>
Additional Charges :		
2/4/2011 1,075 copies		157.50
60 copies		9.00
2/10/2011 380 copies		57.00
2/11/2011 Meals for meeting		90.23
Miscellaneous costs		15.96
2/14/2011 ADOM Templates for Rule 2004 Discovery copies--59 pages		8.85
2/15/2011 Fax & long distance calls		11.83
Copy of Dolan's blog--8 pgs		1.20
Copy of Order--16 pages		2.40
2/16/2011 Copy of Operating Report--26 pages		3.90
2/21/2011 Copy of Archdiocese Confidentiality Orders--50 pages		7.50
3/1/2011 Copies 2/9/11		92.03
Breakaway Delivery Service to Verbatim Reporting 2/24/11		130.00
Original Transcript of 341 hearing		865.50
Total costs		<u>\$1,452.90</u>
Total amount of this bill		<u>\$29,377.90</u>

April 04, 2011

Archdiocese - Case Administration

In Reference To: Case Administration

Invoice # 32298

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/26/2011 AS	Conference with Daryl Diesing on §341, Schedules, Notice etc (1.0)	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
1/27/2011 AS	Conference with Dave Asbach regarding §341	0.30 225.00/hr	67.50
1/28/2011 AS	Conference with Daryl Diesing on parishes issue, other items, §341, current issues and insurance (.6); Notes regarding the same (.2); Conference with Jim Stang regarding Daryl Diesing's points and issues and status and strategy regarding 4-5 items from Daryl Diesing (.6); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing regarding parishes, financials and 5 issues regarding Notice, et al (.8)	2.20 225.00/hr	495.00
1/31/2011 AS	Correspondence from and to Daryl Diesing (.3); Notes on financials (.2); Additional information and correspondence on contact information (.2); Additional correspondence (.1); Conference with Diane Himojosa (.2); Correspondence to parties on Application and §341 (.3)	1.30 225.00/hr	292.50
2/1/2011 AS	Follow up on Documents and notes for §341	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
2/2/2011 AS	Several correspondences from and to Therese & Jeff Anderson offices (.4); Phone calls with Gillian Brown (.1); Phone call and correspondence with Daryl Deising and notes regarding the same (.4); Correspondence with Gillian Brown (.1); Phone call and correspondence from and to Daryl Deising (.2); Phone call and correspondence with Gillian Brown (.2)	1.40 225.00/hr	315.00

Archdiocese - Case Administration

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/3/2011	AS Conference with Gillian Brown regarding status, Affidavit and §341 hearing (.4); Phone call and follow up with Pam Bartoli (.3); Conference with Jeff Anderson (.8); Review of correspondence (.4); Checklist (.1)	2.00 225.00/hr	450.00
2/7/2011	AS Follow up on Documents (.3); Notes regarding Schedules (.2); Follow up on correspondence with Therese Gallagher (.2); Correspondence from Pamela Bartoli on Documents et al (.2); Correspondence to Pamela Bartoli on remaining Documents (.2); Additional correspondence from Pamela Bartoli (.3); Correspondence with Jim Stang (.1)	1.50 225.00/hr	337.50
2/8/2011	JRP Correspondence with Gillian Brown, .2; conference with Attorney Solochek, .2; review of Debtor's schedules, .7.	1.10 200.00/hr	220.00
	AS Review and analysis of Schedules (1.3); Meeting with Peter Ilisley on facts regarding Milwaukee Archdiocese et al (1.3)	2.60 225.00/hr	585.00
2/9/2011	AS Conference call with Jeff Anderson, Mike Finnigan, Gillian Brown, Ken Brown and Pat Wall regarding how to address and approach the §341 hearing and points related thereto--follow up and notes regarding the same (1.2); Correspondence to parties regarding §341 hearing (.8)	2.00 225.00/hr	450.00
	JRP Review debtor's schedules, .3; conference with attorney Solochek regarding 341 and strategy, .4; phone conference with counsel for committee, 1.0.	1.70 200.00/hr	340.00
	AS Review of additional Schedules (.3); Review of Article (.3); Additional notes regarding §341 inquiries (.3); Follow up for Daryl Diesing (.2); Phone call and correspondence to Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence to Jim Stang on Motions (.2); Review and memo regarding Schedules--assets and questions for Conference (.6); Conference with Gillian Brown regarding Schedules and §341 hearing and questions and notes (1.3); Correspondence regarding conference call (.2); Review of correspondence from Gillian Brown (.3); Review of documents and correspondence to Group regarding the same (.4); Notes regarding the same (.1)	4.40 225.00/hr	990.00
2/10/2011	AS Review of Questions and Faith in the Future et al--questions and memo regarding the same et al (1.3); Phone calls with Daryl Diesing (.2); Review of Gillian Brown's outline and revisions (.3); Conference with Dave Asbach and correspondence regarding §341 hearing and notes (.3); Correspondence regarding the same (.1); Conference with and meeting with Dave Asbach regarding §341 hearing and other	4.60 225.00/hr	1,035.00

Archdiocese - Case Administration

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	matters in the case and notes regarding the same (1.2); Correspondence memo to PSZJ and Anderson Group on Asbach meeting (.8); Correspondence from Jim Stang and to Dave Asbach (.4)		
2/11/2011	JRP Meeting with Attorney Solochek, Attorney Brown, Attorney Anderson regarding 341 meeting and case status, 1.0; Attend 341 meeting of creditors, 2.2; Conference with Attorney Solochek and Attorney Brown regarding case status, 1.0	4.20 200.00/hr	840.00
	AS Review of Schedules, Notes and materials for §341 hearing (.6); Meeting with Gillian Brown regarding §341 and case points (.9); Conference with Daryl Diesing (.3); Meeting with Jeff Anderson, Gillian Brown et al regarding §341 (1.3); Attendance and participation in §341 hearing (2.4); Conference with Daryl Diesing regarding the same (.6); Conference with Gillian Brown regarding follow up regarding §341 hearing and items for the case (1.0); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing regarding financials (.3); Review of Faith in the Future et al (.4)	7.80 225.00/hr	1,755.00
2/14/2011	AS Phone call and correspondence to Jim Stang--update regarding §341 and Motion and Notice (.3); Research and analysis on WS 242 on intent and discovery and WS 893 (.9); Review of Dolan articles (.4); Review on several correspondences from Jeff Anderson (.4); Several correspondences from and to Paul Scopture (.4); Correspondence to Group regarding WS 242 and notes regarding the same (.6); Checklist regarding the same (.3); Additional correspondence with Jim Stang (.3)	3.60 225.00/hr	810.00
2/15/2011	JRP Research various legal issues, .4; conference with Attorney Solochek regarding case status, committee meeting, and follow up from 341 meeting, .8.	1.20 200.00/hr	240.00
	AS Notes for Motion and Order per Jim Stang (.3); Notes on WS 242 (.3); Notes on status of report from Daryl Diesing (.3); Review on Documents (.3); Review of Jeff Anderson correspondence and follow up for New York Times (.2); Phone call with Daryl Diesing (.1); Review of motion and correspondence from Jim Stang and response regarding the same (.4); Conference with Paul Vitello from New York Times (.4); Notes and phone call with Daryl Diesing (.1)	2.40 225.00/hr	540.00
2/16/2011	JRP Review correspondence from Attorney James Stang and Gillian Brown	0.30 200.00/hr	60.00
	AS Review of several correspondences and memos on Debtor's Motions, Notice et al (.4); Correspondence to Jim Stang and Group on US Trustee points regarding pre-petition settlements	2.60 225.00/hr	585.00

Archdiocese - Case Administration

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	(.3); Correspondence to Jim Stang and Group on Notice and US Trustee and notes regarding the same (.4); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing regarding Financial Statements (.2); Correspondence regarding Committee and status points (.2); Notes and phone call and correspondence with Daryl Diesing (.1); Conference with Jim Stang on Mediation Notices et al (.6); Conference with Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence with Daryl Diesing (.2)		
2/17/2011 AS	Follow up on 3 Motions (.2); Notes regarding Daryl Diesing and Dave Asbach (.2); Notes on WS 242 & 893 (.3); Phone call and correspondence regarding conference--Jim Stang & Daryl Diesing (.2); Review on WS 893 (.3); Conference with Dave Asbach and Jim Stang regarding Motions, Notices, et al (.6); Conference with Jim Stang regarding the same (.3); Conference with Daryl Diesing and Jim Stang on 3 Motions, documents, Supreme Court et al (.8)	2.90 225.00/hr	652.50
2/18/2011 AS	Conference with Daryl Diesing (.2); Correspondence to Jim Stang and follow up regarding Daryl Diesing (.2); Receipt and process of §341 Audio (.3); Initial review of orders (.3)	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
JRP	Review correspondence from Gillian Brown regarding employment of professionals, .2; follow up on transcript of 341 meeting, .3.	0.50 200.00/hr	100.00
2/21/2011 AS	Follow up on correspondence regarding Mediation program and comments (.3); Correspondence regarding Orders (.2); Correspondence to Daryl Diesing on Order (.3); Correspondence with Gillian Brown (.1); Correspondence with Daryl Diesing (.2)	1.10 225.00/hr	247.50
2/22/2011 AS	Correspondence from Gillian Brown and response regarding Milwaukee Supporting Fund (.3); Review of article and correspondence to Committee et al (.2); Review of electronic filings regarding Certificate and correspondence with Dave Asbach regarding the same (.4); Correspondence to Jim Stang et al on Certificate by US Trustee (.3); Several correspondences from Mike Finnegan on 5 different funds and initial review regarding the same (.3); Notes on pending Motions (.3); Conference with Clerk and modification of order and correspondence to Jim Stang and Gillian Brown (.4)	2.20 225.00/hr	495.00
2/23/2011 AS	Notes on Insurance (.3); Review of Agenda and correspondence regarding the same (.4)	0.70 225.00/hr	157.50

Archdiocese - Case Administration

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/1/2011	AS Review of correspondence and electronic filings with Court and notes regarding the same (.4); Review of Dolan correspondence (.2)	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/2/2011	JRP Review CM/ECF filings, .3; various correspondences to Gillian Brown and attorneys for the committee, .4.	0.70 200.00/hr	140.00
3/3/2011	ANH Review of 2004 (local rules compliance) (.9); Review of agenda and proposed bar date issues (.4); Participation in conference call with Creditor Committee (1.0)	2.30 225.00/hr	517.50
3/4/2011	JRP Correspondence from Jim Stang regarding Claims bar date, .2; conference with Attorney Herbach regarding committee meeting, .2.	0.40 200.00/hr	80.00
	AS Review of filings and correspondence from mailing list (.3); Review of correspondence and notes regarding Jim Stang on Notice (.3); Review of correspondence with Daryl Deising on dates and Jim Stang and notes regarding the same (.4); Review of correspondence from Jeff Anderson (.2)	1.20 225.00/hr	270.00
3/7/2011	AS Review of Proof of Claim (.2); Review of Jim Stang correspondence and Pat Wall correspondence (.2)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
3/8/2011	AS Review of draft Agenda (.2); Review of correspondence and notes regarding Daryl Deising and documents (.2)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
3/9/2011	JRP Conference with Attorney Herbach regarding strategy, .2, review court docket and filings, .2	0.40 200.00/hr	80.00
	AS Review of correspondence with Committee conference and bylaws (.3); Review of correspondence regarding preservation of records (.3); Additional correspondence regarding the same (.2); Review of correspondence and correspondence to Jim Stang on Agenda (.2)	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
3/10/2011	AS Review of the Agenda items and notes regarding the same (.6)	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
	JRP Review correspondence from Attorney Jim Stang, .2; review agenda and prep for creditor's committee meeting, .3; attend creditor's committee meeting and notes regarding the same, 1.3.	1.80 200.00/hr	360.00
3/14/2011	JRP Review docket and electronic filings, .5; phone conference with Attorney Solocheck regarding case status and newly filed motions, .3; phone call to Gillian Brown, .2.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00

Archdiocese - Case Administration

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	
3/14/2011	AS	Review of Motions on Confidentiality and motions on therapy and mediation (.6); Conference with Attorney Pilmaier regarding the same (.3); Notes and correspondence (.3); Additional correspondence and electronic filings (.3); Notes regarding the same (.1)	1.60 225.00/hr	360.00
3/15/2011	AS	Review of correspondence and notes regarding Response to Motion (.3)	0.30 225.00/hr	67.50
3/16/2011	JRP	Review correspondence from Jim Stang regarding various motions, .2; review correspondence from Daryl Diesing regarding motions and conference, .2; phone call to Attorney Gillian Brown regarding motion and objection dates, .2; conference with attorney Solochek regarding status, .2.	0.80 200.00/hr	160.00
3/17/2011	AS	Review of correspondence--meeting and bylaws (.4); Review of Dean Westwalk correspondence et al (.3); Correspondence to Jim Stang et al regarding the same (.4)	1.10 225.00/hr	247.50
	JRP	Review agenda and preparation for creditor's committee meeting, .3; attend creditor's committee meeting and notes regarding the same, 1.1.	1.40 200.00/hr	280.00
3/18/2011	AS	Follow up and review strategy (.4)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
3/21/2011	AS	Review of correspondence and electronic filings	0.80 225.00/hr	180.00
3/22/2011	AS	Review of correspondence on hearing (.4); Follow up on response (.3); Review of Jeff Anderson notes (.3)	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
3/23/2011	AS	Follow up on Motion and Requests	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/24/2011	JRP	Correspondence with Ken Brown and Gillian Brown regarding pending motions and hearing, .2; phone conference regarding pending motions and issues related to upcoming conference with Debtor, .3, attend creditor's committee meeting and preparation for the same, 1.2.	1.70 200.00/hr	340.00
	AS	Review of correspondence regarding hearing (.4); Review of correspondence and Motions and response and 4/5 date (.6); Correspondence with Ken Brown and Gillian Brown (.4); Follow up regarding hearing before Judge Kelly (.4); Notes (.2); Review of Agenda (.3)	2.30 225.00/hr	517.50

Archdiocese - Case Administration

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/28/2011	JRP Correspondence with Daryl Diesing and Michael Gosman regarding Motion and hearing on Motions	0.30 200.00/hr	60.00
	AS Notes on Motion status et al	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/29/2011	JRP Review status with Jeff Anderson and Mike Finnigan, .3; conference with Daryl Diesing and the court clerk regarding hearing on pending motions, .3; correspondence with Gillian Brown and Ken Brown regarding hearing, .2.	0.80 200.00/hr	160.00
	AS Follow up on Motion regarding 4/5 (.4); correspondence with Daryl Diesing regarding hearings (.4); notes with Jeff Anderson (.3)	1.10 225.00/hr	247.50
3/30/2011	JRP Review and preparation on Objections to various motions filed by the Debtor and correspondence regarding the same, .4; correspondence with Gillian Brown regarding April 5 hearing and Debtor's motions, .2.	0.60 200.00/hr	120.00
	AS Follow up on correspondence - filings - with Ken Brown	0.80 225.00/hr	180.00
3/31/2011	JRP Preparation for creditor's committee meeting and attendance at creditor's committee meeting, 1.3.	1.30 200.00/hr	260.00
	AS Numerous correspondences with Gillian and Ken Brown and Jim Stang on Debtors motion and 4/5 hearing (1.0); Review of Objection for 4/5 hearing and preparation regarding the same (.9); Review of electronic filing and correspondence to all (.6)	2.50 225.00/hr	562.50
	For professional services rendered	<u>88.00</u>	<u>\$19,295.00</u>

April 04, 2011

Archdiocese-Applications

In Reference To: Applications

Invoice # 32299

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/26/2011	JRP	Phone call with Attorney Stang regarding Applications to Employ, .3; Conference with Attorney Solochek regarding Applications to Employ and case status, .3; Preparation on Applications to Employ, Affidavit and Proposed Order, .7.	1.30 200.00/hr	260.00
	AS	Preparation and draft of Application regarding Retention (.8); Research regarding the same (.3); Correspondence and follow up regarding Application and conference (.2); Follow up on Application (.3)	1.60 225.00/hr	360.00
1/27/2011	JRP	Preparation on Applications to Employ and Affidavit, .4; review with Attorney Solochek, .2.	0.60 200.00/hr	120.00
	AS	Several correspondences from and to Jim Stang regarding Applications, Debtor Application, §341, Committee meeting et al (.4); Conference with Jim Stang regarding Applications and Document's Applications (.4); Additional correspondence regarding the same (.3); Draft of language for Attorney Solochek Affidavit and Application and correspondence regarding the same (.4); Preparation regarding the same (.3); Notes and correspondence on Committee By Laws (.3); Conference with Clerk Lawa on Document's Application (.2); Additional preparation on Applications (.3)	2.30 225.00/hr	517.50
1/28/2011	AS	Follow up regarding Committee Applications (.4); Review of correspondence regarding the same (.3)	0.70 225.00/hr	157.50

Archdiocese-Applications

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/31/2011	AS Follow up correspondence and Applications (.2); Review of items requested (.2)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
2/2/2011	AS Follow up on Applications (.2); Review of materials (.2)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
2/3/2011	AS Review of checklist (.3); Receipt of Applications and follow up for filing (.3)	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
2/5/2011	JRP Assemble and electronically file applications to employ counsel and local counsel for creditor's committee, .4; conference with Attorney Solochek regarding applications, .2	0.60 200.00/hr	120.00
2/23/2011	JRP Review docket entries; prepare and file affidavits of no objection and proposed orders to employment applications.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
	AS Follow up on Retention Order and correspondence regarding the same	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
2/28/2011	ANH Prepared draft quantity application form	0.90 225.00/hr	202.50
3/30/2011	JRP Review professional application and supporting documents	0.30 200.00/hr	60.00
	For professional services rendered	<u>11.10</u>	<u>\$2,402.50</u>

April 04, 2011

Archdiocese-Claims

In Reference To: Claims of creditors
Invoice # 32300

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/25/2011 AS	Review of recession issue and analysis and review and analysis regarding fraudulent inducement (.8); Correspondence and memo to Jim Stang regarding the same (.6); Correspondence from and to Jim Stang regarding the same (.6); Conference with Jim Stang on Fraudulent inducement, Notice, Claims, special hearing et al (.8); Memo regarding the same (.2); Correspondence from Dave Asbach and comments regarding the same (.4)	3.40 225.00/hr	765.00
	For professional services rendered	<u>3.40</u>	<u>\$765.00</u>

April 04, 2011

Archdiocese-Credit Committee

In Reference To: Meetings and Consultations with Credit Committee

Invoice # 32302

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/28/2011 AS	Correspondence to Charles Linneman, Jeff Anderson and Mike Finnegan regarding Applications (.3)	0.30 225.00/hr	67.50
1/30/2011 AS	Review of Jim Stang correspondence regarding Committee et al (.3); Correspondence from Jeff Anderson and parties regarding the same and Attorney Solochek's responses regarding the same and §341 (.4); Review of additional list of items (.3); Notes for the §341 (.3)	1.30 225.00/hr	292.50
1/31/2011 AS	Note on Committee Rules	0.20 225.00/hr	45.00
2/4/2011 AS	Receipt and initial review of materials from Patrick Wall (.8); Correspondence to and from Charles Linneman regarding Application regarding Retention (.3); Correspondence from Pamela Bartoli and correspondence to Group regarding schedules (.3); Notes regarding schedules (.3); Initial review of information from Pamela Bartoli (.3)	2.00 225.00/hr	450.00
2/8/2011 AS	Correspondence memo to Anderson Group regarding the Schedules et al	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
2/9/2011 AS	Correspondence to Committee and Anderson Group	0.20 225.00/hr	45.00
2/14/2011 AS	Correspondence to Committee and Anderson Group on Article (.3); Correspondence with Committee (.2)	0.50 225.00/hr	112.50

Archdiocese-Credit Committee

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/15/2011	AS Notes on Committee Meeting	0.20 225.00/hr	45.00
2/16/2011	JRP Review notes to Creditors Committee	0.20 200.00/hr	40.00
2/17/2011	JRP Preparation and attendance at meeting of creditor's committee.	1.50 200.00/hr	300.00
	AS Notes regarding Committee meeting (.2); Conference call with Creditor Committee regarding status, issues et al (1.8)	2.00 225.00/hr	450.00
2/18/2011	AS Notes and follow up from conference call with Creditor Committee	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
2/21/2011	AS Review of correspondence from Jim Stang and Jeff Anderson regarding 2 Motions--correspondence to and from Jim Stang regarding the same	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
2/24/2011	JRP Review multiple correspondence from Attorney Jim Stang, .5, Attend Creditors committee meeting, 1.3	1.80 200.00/hr	360.00
	AS Review of Agenda--insurance--state of order et al (.8); Notes on 242 item(.2); Review of Proof of Claim and confirmation orders (.3); Correspondence from and to and from Jim Stang regarding entities (.2); Notes regarding the same (.1); Conference call with Creditor Committee and memo regarding the same (1.3)	2.90 225.00/hr	652.50
2/28/2011	AS Review of Jeff Anderson correspondence, checklist and Dolan articles	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
	For professional services rendered	<u>15.10</u>	<u>\$3,310.00</u>

April 04, 2011

Archdiocese-Discovery

In Reference To: Discovery

Invoice # 32303

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2/21/2011	AS	Notes on 2004s (.2); Review of 2004 Template and comments regarding the same (.8)	1.00 225.00/hr	225.00
3/4/2011	JRP	Review correspondence from Gillian Brown regarding Rule 2004 documents, .2; research regarding the same, .2;	0.40 200.00/hr	80.00
3/7/2011	JRP	Review various correspondences and drafts of discovery hold letter, .7; initial review of 2004 requests, .3, conference with Attorney Solochek regarding 2004 requests, .2.	1.20 200.00/hr	240.00
	AS	Review of correspondence from Jeff Anderson on Hold Letter (.2)	0.20 225.00/hr	45.00
3/8/2011	AS	Notes, review and comments regarding Litigation Hold Letter (.4)	0.40 225.00/hr	90.00
3/9/2011	JRP	Correspondence with Gillian Brown regarding 2004 requests,	0.30 200.00/hr	60.00
3/10/2011	AS	Review of 2004 and comments	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/15/2011	AS	Review of correspondence and 2004 Discovery and correspondence with Gillian Brown and Daryl Diesing (.6); Correspondence regarding the same and memo regarding the Discovery (.3)	0.90 225.00/hr	202.50
3/16/2011	JRP	Review 2004 documents	0.30 200.00/hr	60.00

Archdiocese-Discovery

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/25/2011	JRP Review correspondence from Gillian Brown and Ken Brown regarding pending motions and 2004 requests, .3; phone conference with Attorney Jeff Anderson and Mike Finnigan regarding upcoming hearing and pending meeting, .3; phone conference with Daryl Diesing, and committee counsel regarding motions and 2004 request issues, 1.0.	1.60 200.00/hr	320.00
	AS Follow up on discovery - 4/5 date et al	0.60 225.00/hr	135.00
3/28/2011	JRP Correspondence with Gillian Brown and Ken Brown regarding motions and 2004 status, .3; review correspondence regarding employment of professional, .2; phone conference with Gillian Brown and Frank Lococo regarding 2004 documents and system for document delivery and review, .5.	1.00 200.00/hr	200.00
3/31/2011	JRP Preparation on Notice of Motions and Certificate of service regarding 2004 motion, .4; multiple correspondence regarding preparation, review, and filing of the 2004 motion, .3; phone conference with Attorney Ken Brown, .2	0.90 200.00/hr	180.00
	AS Review of correspondence, memos, etc regarding 2004 motion and filing regarding the same	0.80 225.00/hr	180.00
	For professional services rendered	<u>10.20</u>	<u>\$2,152.50</u>

April 04, 2011

Archdiocese-Costs

In Reference To: Costs

Invoice # 32301

Additional Charges :

	<u>Amount</u>
2/4/2011 1,075 copies	157.50
60 copies	9.00
2/10/2011 380 copies	57.00
2/11/2011 Meals for meeting	90.23
Miscellaneous costs	15.96
2/14/2011 ADOM Templates for Rule 2004 Discovery copies--59 pages	8.85
2/15/2011 Fax & long distance calls	11.83
Copy of Dolan's blog--8 pgs	1.20
Copy of Order--16 pages	2.40
2/16/2011 Copy of Operating Report--26 pages	3.90
2/21/2011 Copy of Archdiocese Confidentiality Orders--50 pages	7.50
3/1/2011 Copies 2/9/11	92.03
Breakaway Delivery Service to Verbatim Reporting 2/24/11	130.00
Original Transcript of 341 hearing	865.50
Total costs	<u>\$1,452.90</u>